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commentLeave a commentQ: How to access package
information from a from: TAB key in Zend Framework

2 I have a Zend Framework 2 rest api. I have a
skeleton that uses this: rest = $rest; } } And in the
AbstractRestController, I have this: public function

setRest(RestController $rest) 0cc13bf012

// Copyright 2009 the Sputnik authors. All rights
reserved. // This code is governed by the BSD license

found in the LICENSE file. /** * @name:
S15.10.1.4_A3_T1.1; * @section: 15.10.1.4; *

@assertion: If (Eq(fractionDigits, 0)) and
(Eq(DecimalDigits, 1)), * parseFloat(value) is NaN; *

@description: value is NaN; */ //CHECK#1 if
(parseFloat(NaN)!== parseFloat(NaN)) {

$ERROR('#1: parseFloat(NaN) === parseFloat(NaN).
Actual:'+ (parseFloat(NaN))); } [A case of surgical

management of life-threatening bleeding from
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esophageal varices secondary to hepatoma
metastases]. The patient was a 72-year-old male

with hepatoma-induced portal hypertension.
Esophageal varices were diagnosed by upper

gastrointestinal endoscopy, and the patient was
scheduled for endoscopic ligation. However, massive
and intermittent gastrointestinal bleeding occurred
despite a sufficient preparation for the endoscopic
procedure. As additional procedures, emergency
esophageal variceal ligation (EVL), emergency

transjugular intrahepatic portosystemic shunt (TIPS)
and emergency surgery for lower gastrointestinal

bleeding were performed. Emergency EVL for
bleeding from esophageal varices is useful for acute

bleeding, but bleeding recurred after two EVLs. A
TIPS is a useful technique for the treatment of acute
gastrointestinal bleeding from a portal hypertensive
state, but the TIPS is technically difficult and carries
a risk of portal vein thrombosis. In addition, the TIPS
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procedure is currently not a first-line treatment for
esophageal varices because this procedure is a

palliative one. There has been no report of
emergency esophageal variceal ligation for a large

esophageal varix, and in this case, the bleeding
stopped immediately after surgery. Emergency
surgery for lower gastrointestinal bleeding is a

therapeutic choice in a patient with portal
hypertension and is indicated for non-bleeding

varices or varices with ruptured into the peritoneal
cavity.Q: How to
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